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UNCLASSIFIED
Official
Clarisse, Yehudit —
From: Rothenberg, Samuel F
Sent: Tuesday, April 17, 2018 9:07 PM
To: Rothenberg, Samuel F
Subject: FW: Invitational Travel Request Has Been Approved
Attachments: Request for Approving Invitational Travel Form - rothenberg-other.html

Official
UNCLASSIFIED

From: Travel <do_not_reply_SP2010@state.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, April 17, 2018 6:43 PM

To: Rothenberg, Samuel F <RothenbergSF@state.gov>

Cc: NEA-EX-Travel-Validate <NEA-EX-Travel-Validate @state.gov>; NEA-SCA/EX_FM_Travel-Approvers-DL <NEA-
SCA/EX_FM_Travel-Approvers-DL@state.gov>

Subject: Invitational Travel Request Has Been Approved

Greetings,

Your Invitational Travel request has been approved. Please make a PDF or TIFF of the approved form, plus all
supporting documentation, and attach it to your E2 Travel request as per STATE 065713. Your travel request
cannot be processed until this approved form is attached to your E2 Travel request.

To convert the form to a TIFF, open the link below, choose “File, Print," then select “Microsoft Office
Document Image Writer” as the printer, and select “Print.” Next, you will be asked to “Name” the file, and
“Save” it (default location is “My Documents™). Click “Save” and attach the TIFF file to your email. If further
assistance is required creating the attachment, contact NEA-EX-Travel-Validate@state.gov.

Your approved request form can be found Rothenberg-Other.

Thank you.

Clarisse, Yehudit UNCLASSIFIED
Official
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Bureaus of Near Eastern Affairs and South and Central Asian Affairs
Executive Office (NEA-SCA/EX)

request for approval of invitational travel

This form is used to request approval of invitational travel. It is submitted to the Executive
Director.

Please consult REF: 2 FAM 962.1- Gifts of Invitational Travel in advance to determine if the
offer meets

Department of State guidelines for possible acceptance.

To: NEA-SCA/EX Executive Director

From: (person submitting the request) Last Name: Wthenberg First Name:
[Samuel | Middle: ]F |

Agency/Office: Post: |Jerusalem [

Intended recipient if other than above:
Name: | |

Agency/Office: [ /| Post:|

The invitation must accompany this request. Please attach a copy of the invitation here:

Getting Ready to Sweden - Workshop with Prof. Dan Shapiro.msg
201.5 KB

Also, please attach documentation showing that the initial travel has been approved:

Rothenberg_Sweden_TA.pdf
12.75 KB

Acceptance Letter .pdf

- . . , 485.67 KB
Attach additional documentation here, i.e. emails, etc. :

I request approval to accept an offer of invitational travel that has been proffered by (Select
the appropriate entity below and indicate the exact source):

Proffered By: [University or other Educational institution | Source: |Folke Bernadette Acader]

By submitting this request, I certify that the proposed travel represents a priority use of the
recipient’s time. Following are pertinent details regarding this offer -

1. Background (briefly state the terms of the offer and include the dates of the proposed travel

below): _
[The April 22-27, 201 |

2. How does this travel relate to the employee’s duties? (briefly explain below):



512

E;HADES is a large gr :l

3. Is the employee speaking in a public forum, and if so, has the employee cleared the

engagement through PA/PL
(Office of Public Liaison & Intergovernmental Affairs; email clearance request to “PA

Clearances Mailbox.”)?
[no |

4. Is the employee traveling for the minimum time necessary to carry out USG business?

5. Does the donor have any business pending before the Department?
(e.g., no, to the best of my knowledge): no |

6. Would acceptance of the travel create real or apparent conflict of interest? In other words,
would a reasonable person believe that the traveling official or the Department would lose
objectivity as a result of accepting the travel donation? (No - explain briefly why not below):

INO. I am posted to

7. Does your office have funding to pay for this trip?
(e.g., no, our office does not have the funding for this trip): lyes |

8. If your office had sufficient funding to pay for this trip, would you do so?
Iyes, but the required Iodgl

9. Value of the travel: ]$1.828 |

Ticket(s)* [$1,150 |

Mode of travel |airplane ]

Hotel [$278 |
Meals Iﬁ[} |

Other* I$200 estimated transportl

[* as applicable, and please identify “other” as well as the value.]

Official Use Only Reviewer Section:

Review Status: [Review Approved v/ Reviewer Submit

Reviewer's Comments:

L |

Final Approval Section:

~ITravel Approved - the offer appears to meet the requirements of 2 FAM 962
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[ 1 Travel Denied - the offer does not meet the requirements of 2 FAM 962

Approver's Comments:

Signature of Authorizing Official: I SignJ lVanVranken, Howard Un-Sign

Office: [HST - 6254 Date: [2018-04-17

| Final Approver Submit I

NEA-SCA/EX Form to Request for Approval of Invitational Travel 20100603
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E2 Travel Voucher

Fri Nov 02 01:50:03 CDT 2018

PRIVACY ACT NOTICE: Tne following informaticn is provided to comply with the Privacy Act of 1974(P.S. 93-579}. The information reguested on the
form is required under the provisions of 5 U.5.C. Chapter 57(as amended), Executive Orders 11609 of July 22, 1971, and 1102 of March 27, 1962, for
the purpose of facilitating authorization action.and the request for advance of funds for travel and other expenses to be incurred. under administrative.
The infarmation contained in this form will be used by the Federai agency officers and employees who have a need for such-information in the
performance of their duties. Information will be transferred to appropriate Federal, State, local, or foreign agencies when relevant to Givil, criminal or
régulatory investigations, or prosecutions. Failure to provide the information required will resulf in delay or suspension of the processing of this form,

Voucher Information

43518T000392 Closed Voucher 9185661 2018-05-08 2018-05-17

B}
SAMUEL F ROTHENBERG  Jerusalem, JE ConGen Jerusalem Yes.

18 - 20 Agron Road 072-2-622 7245 N/A
Jerusalem 91002, Jerusalem
JER

CCONUS Rothenberg Stockholm 22 ; No

Aprit oy

2018-04-22 thru 2018-04-27

inerary

2018-04-22 2018-04-22 N/A Jerusalem, JER NONE No CP

2018-04-22  2018-04-27  NA Stockhoir, SWE. NONE No cP 1‘*[2";2?? Duty, LDG $232, M
2018-04-27  2018-04-27  N/A Jerusalem, JER NONE No NONE

PA-C = Government auto available and committed
PA-NA = Government auto riot available
PA-NC = Government aufo avaitable and not committed

Voucher Ekpense Totals

0.00 0.00- 408.50 0.00 53.97 0.00 15.10 478.57

Page 1 of 6
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Voucher Accounting Information

R

Segment Names: Agency. u}elau egin Budge . ' ' ;

YriAppropriation/Bureau/Allotrdent/Opierating _ 0.00 0.00 ¢.00 0.00

Allowance/Function/Object/Project/Property/Organization/Repordi

ng Category/Obligation Number

1900/2018/19___801130002/NEA/4435/443500/1100/21 B3/NAN . ] _

ANANAMA43SET0226 15.10 0.00 463.47 478.57
15.10 0.00 463.47 478.57

Traveler Payment Summary

R

483.47 0.00 463.47

Traveler Payment Details

FEDERAL.
435187000392 001 US Doltar 463.47 EFT SAVINGS 1 463.47
BANK

Voucher Ekpense Summary

Jerusalem, JER Misc Voucher Transaction Fee 15.10
Stockholm, SWE. Local Transport Taxi §3.97
Stockhoim, SWE Ledging Lodging 0,00 Perdiem
Stockholm, SWE Meals & Incidentals Meals Perdiem 409.50 Perdism
Stockholm, SWE Transport Airfare 0.00

Voucher Expense Lines

. ; . TLV/STO/SU
Stockholm, SWE Transport Airfare 0.00 none 0.00 VISTOTLY

Page 2 of 6
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, 2018.04-
22
2018-04-

3 22

. 2018-04-
2

] 2018-04-
23
2018-04-

& 23
2018-04-

7 24

8 2018-04~
24
2018.04-

9 25
2018-04-

10 25
2018-04-

11 26
2018-04-

2 4
2018-04-

w2
2018-04-

w 20
2018-04-

CI

Stockhalm, SWE

Stockholm, SWE

Stockholm, SWE

Stockholm, SWE

Stockholm, SWE

Stackholm, SWE

Stockhoim, SWE

Stockhalm, SWE

Stockhalm, SWE

Stockholm, SWE

Stockholm, SWE

Stockhalm, SWE.

Stockholm, SWE

Jerusalem, JER

Voucher Remarks

Authorization Remarks - Trip ID: 9185661

Arranger - KIRREH, SALIM F

e AR

Lodging Lodging

Meals & Incidentals Meals Perdiem

Local Transport Taxi

Lodging Lodging

Meals & Incidentals Meals Perdiem

Lodging Lodging

Meals & Incidentals Meals Perdiem

Lodging Lodging

Meais & Incidentals Meals Perdiem

Lodging Lodging

feals & Incidentals Meals Perdiem.

Lodging Lodging

Meals & Incidentals Meals Perdiem

Voucher

Misc Transaction Fee

April 17,2018 at 07:33 AM

0.00

34.00

0.00

34.00

0.00

34.00

0.00

77.00

0.00

102.25

15.10

Perdiem

Perdiem

none

Perdiem

Perdiem

Perdiern

Perdiemn

Perdiem

Perdiem

Perdigm

Perdiem

Peardiem

Perdiem

none

0.00 nons

128.25 none

hotelto

5387 oot

0.00 none

34.00 none

0.00 none

34.00 none

0.00 none

34.00 none

0.00 none

77.00 none

0.00 none

102.25 none

Voucher
15.10 Transaction
Fee

Invitational fravel is hereby authorized from Jerusalem to Stackholm, Sweden ofa 22 April 2018 on to Sundsvall, Sweden back to Stockholm and return
to Jerusalem ofa 27 April 2018, to attend SHADE training program,.

SHADE covers all travel, lodging and most of the meals.

Page 3 of &
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This trip is- parl of an invitational training program run by an Israeli Palestinian NGO called SHADES. SHADES waorks with the Harvard Law School
Program on Negotiation to run separate and joint negotiation training sessions fior 10 Palestinians, 10 Jsraelis, and 10 foreign diplomats who are
stakehoiders in resoiving the Israeli-Palestinian confiict. The program helps participants become more effective negotiators, provides them a forum to
exchange ideas, and helps them develop the long-term relationships necessary to cement a lasting peace.

Voucher Remarks - Voucher 1D: 8185861(1)

Traveler - ROTHENBERG, SAMUEL F May 08, 2018 at04:47 AM

Attaching NEA-SCA/EX. approval for invitational travel. Alf airfare and lodging, and most meals, were covered by the training organizers.

Traveler - ROTHENBERG, SAMUEL F May 08, 2018-at 04:57 AM

| hereby assign to the United States any right | may have against any parties in connection with reimbursable transportation charges described below,
purchased under cash payment procedures. {(41CFR 101-41.203-2}. | certify that this voucher is true and correct to the best of my knowledge and belief,

-and that payrnent or ¢redit has not been received by me.

Approver - ALEKSANDROWVA, SILVIYA S May 15, 2018 at 02:00 AM

Voucher checked.

Audit/Approver Information

Approved [S42504 JERUSALEM

TURNERJM@STATE.GOV [TURNER, JAMES] 2018-05-08

ECONOMIC]

Approved [S00000.JERUSALEM  ALEKSANDROVASS@STATE.GOV 2018-05-15
P3UVOUC] [ALEKSANDROVA, SILVIYA]

Approved [S00000 PSU PALARCALD@STATE.GOV [PALARCA, 2018-05-17
CERTIFYING OFF] LEILANI]

Page 4 of &



17APR18 Tue 07:04AM
17APR18 Tue 07:04AM
17APR18 Tue 07:04AM
17APR18 Tue 07:36AM
17APR18 Tue 07:36AM
17APR18 Tue 07:36AM
17APR18 Tue 07:41AM
17APR18 Tue 07:42AM
17APR18 Tue 07:42AM
17APR18 Tue 08:34AM
17APR18 Tue 08:34AM
17APR18 Tue 08:34AM
17APR18 Tue D3:34AM
17APR18 Tug 09:37AM
17APR18 Tue 09:37AM
17APR18 Tue 08:39AM
17APR18 Tue 09:3%AM
17APR18 Tue 09:38AM
17APR18 Tue 09:39AM
17APR18 Tue 09:39AM
08MAY 18 Tue 04:4TAM
08MAY18 Tue 04:41AM
08MAY18 Tue 04:48AM
08MAY18 Tue 04:48AM

08MAY 18 Tue 04:48AM

Current status New Authorization

Created by SALIM F KIRRER for SAMUEL F ROTHENBERG
Created for Minar Customear;-Jerusalem - Economic Section (S43504)
Current status: Pending Authorization Approval

Trip ID 9185661 submitted to S43504 JERUSALENM ECONOMIC Approver by KIRREH, SALIM F

Justification code submitted by KiRREH, SALIM F - Justification for CABINCLASS - Coach: Within
policy

TURNER, JAMES J locked document for Approval..

Trip ID 9185661 Approved By 543504 JERUSALEM ECONOMIC Approver TURNER, JAMES J
Trip 1D 9185661 Submitted to S43500 JERUSALEM GSO by System

KANiA, JAMES J locked document fqr Approval.

Trip ID 9185661 Approved By S43500 JERUSALEM GSO Approver KANIA, JAMES J

Trip 1D 9185661 Submitted to S43500 JERUSALEM ACCCUNTING by System

ATTIAS, RUTH G locked document fgr Appraval.

Trip ID 8185661 Approved By S43500 JERUSALEM ACCOUNTING Approver ATTIAS, RUTH G
Trip ID-9185661 Submitted to 543500 JERUSALEM CERTIFYING QFFICERS by System’
LLORET, FRANCISCO L locked document for Appraval,

Current status: Authorization Approved

Trip iD 9185661 Approved By S43500 JERUSALEM.CERTIFYING OFFICERS Approver LLORET,
FRANCISCO L

Agency successfully notified of event: TripAuthorizationApproved for trip 9185661
Obligation Request Approved by DOS for Trip Id: 8185661

Voucher 1 ¢reated by SAMUEL F ROTHENBERG

Created for Minor Customer:Jerusalem ~ Economic Section {§43504)

Attachment Stockholm cab.pdf added by SAMUEL F ROTHENBERG

Attachment Return Stockholm Tel Aviv 27April.pdf added by SAMUEL F ROTHENBERG

Attachment Stockholm Sundsvall 22Apr.pdf added by SAMLUEL F ROTHENBERG

Page 50f6
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08MAY 18 Tue 04:48AM

D8MAY1E Tus 04:54AM

08MAY 18 Tue D4:57AM

08MAY 18 Tue 04:57AM

08MAY18 Tue 05:15AM.

08MAY18 Tue 05:15AM
08MAY 18 Tue 05:15AM
14MAY18 Mon 08:25AM
15MAY 18 Tue 0Z:00AM
15MAY18 Tue 02:00AM
17MAY18 Thu 12:13AM
17MAY18 Thu 12:13AM
17MAY18 Thu 12:13AM
17MAY 18 Thu 12:13AM
17MAY18 Thu 12:13AM
17MAY18 Thu 12:13AM

17MAY18 Thu 12:13AM

A BRI

Attachment Sundsvall Stockholm 26Apr.pdf added by SAMUEL F ROTHENBERG

Attachment NEA-SCAEX Invitational Travel Approval.pdf added by SAMUEL F ROTHENBERG

Trip 9185661 Voucher 1 current. status: Pending Voucher Approval

Voucher ID 1 submitted to $43504 JERUSALEM ECONOMIC Approver by ROTHENBERG,
SAMUEL F

TURNER, JAMES J locked Vouchier(1} for Approval.
Voucher 1 approved by 843504 JERUSALEM ECONOMIC Appraver TURNER, JAMES J
Voucher 1 submitted to S00000 JERUSALEM PSU VCUCHER EXAMINERS Approver by System

ALEKSANDRCVA,; SILVIYA S locked Voucher(1) for Approval.

Voucher 1 approved by S00000 JERUSALEM PSU VOUCHER EXAMINERS Approver
ALEKSANDROVA, SILVIYA S

Voucher 1 submitted to S00000 PSU CER_TIFYING’0FFICER-«'V_OUCHER ONLY Approver by
System

PALARCA, LEILANI D locked Voucher({1} for Approval.

Trip 8185661 Voucher 1 current status: Voucher Awaiting Payment

Voucher 1 approved by S00000 PSU CERTIFYING OFFICER - VOUCHER ONLY final Approver
PALARCA, LEILANI D

Agency successfully notified of event; TripWoucherApproved for trip 8185661, voucher 1
Trip 9185661 Voucher 1 current status: Closed Voucher
Current status: Closed Voucher

Voucher Request Appraved by DOS for Trip 1d: 9185661, Voucher:1

Page 6 of &



